
Diya and Kalash Decoration 

 

 

In celebration of the festival of lights, Diwali, the Drawing Department at 
Jagran College of Arts, Science, and Commerce organized a vibrant and creative 
event on 21 Oct 2022, centered around the decoration of kalash and diyas. The 
event aimed to infuse the campus with the festive spirit of Diwali while 
providing students with an opportunity to showcase their artistic talents. The 
event commenced with students from all the departments coming together to 
adorn kalash and diyas with intricate designs and vibrant colors. Kalash, 
symbolizing prosperity and auspiciousness, were embellished with traditional 
motifs and patterns, while diyas, representing the triumph of light over 
darkness, were adorned with decorative accents and embellishments. 
Collaborative efforts fostered a sense of camaraderie among participants, as 
they worked together to create stunning decorative pieces that captured the 
essence of Diwali. As the campus came alive with the vibrant hues of decorated 
kalash and diyas, a festive atmosphere permeated throughout Jagran College. 
Students, faculty, and staff members came together to admire the artwork and 
revel in the joyous spirit of Diwali, fostering a sense of unity and togetherness. 
Yashasvi Singh(B.com2), Ayush Kashyap(BCA 2) Tanisha 
Manchandani(B.Com 1) and Disha Singh (BA 1) bagged first, second and third 
respectively in Kalash Decoration. In Diya decoration the winners were Pihu 
Shivhare (BA1) stood first, Shreyanshi Singh(B.Com 3) and Gracy Khemani 
(BBA1)stood second,  Surabhi Sachan (B.Com H 1)and Mansi Singh (BA2) 
stood third. 

 


